REGD.NO.D. L.-33004/99

ot d S Ter-33004/99

Che G azette of India

_ EX'IRAORDINARY
IR [[—¥vE 3—39-WYE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (ii)

T 4 v
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

H. 455) 7§ feoett, Ypar, =E 5, 2006/ AW 15, 1928
No. 455] - NEW DELHIL FRIDAY, MAY 5, 2006/'VAISAKHA 15, 1928

At sk IET HAEE
(st e s dasdx fawmm)
Ffere
7 fewell, 5 7, 2006
WAL 657(H).—A¥e Fram 2003a?r3ﬂ?mﬁa=rm#$ﬁ‘wa?ﬁmﬁumm
wred, Y AffwE, 1970 (1970 @1 39) W g1 150 FRT HRT WKW F WM W W, TR B
UAUH, HEERE, W 2, €S 3, ouge (i), o 30 REs 2005 ¥ W R o aftre 3k
e dare (e B ol e favm) &Y sfgE do H0sn0 1844 (3), TRIE 30 RER
2005 & 3 yoi¥a f&ar @1, R W ot afddl § Ree oud maifda 89 & e
& ou T ¥, Rt 36 e @, Rred sige i 3, sfe s @ svas o @
off, fﬂqﬁqﬁaﬂﬁaﬁm%g&mmwmwa
mmaﬁ@mmmaﬁm 2 SFE, 2006 aﬁmaﬁmaﬂrﬁﬂé |
of ;-
eﬁmmﬁaﬁ%ﬁﬁa#wﬁmmﬂﬁaﬂv@wﬁhwmﬁaﬁ
FT fom
¥, 9E, PR WK e Fuw, 1970 (1970 FT 39) I GW 150 EWT NeT wfewdl @
wa FgY, e Fam, 2003 # Sk v on @ g Pefafea fFow e 8 oeifa -

1. (1) & Framt F1 fng W 98 () ATE, 2006 B |
(é)ﬁwﬁmmﬁmwﬁﬂsﬁ!
2. déaﬁwmeﬁ(ﬁ%mquaﬁwmw%)ﬁw4$mﬁm()

H -

(® @e i) ¥ “uwr 39, %m1%$mm@¢%ﬁ#maﬂtmmm
: farm s |

(@) (11) &1 @ fHar S |

3. qaﬁm’ta%ﬁwsa%wﬁw(ﬂﬁ tﬂgairﬂa‘mﬁmmf '

1374 GI/2006 (1



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY {ParT II—SEC. 3(ii)]

4. o P & fam 7 & suheE (2 8-
(@ Ee (@) # ‘“wT T® & 9N, “msﬂamﬁasmm#’_mﬁsﬁwﬁaﬁw
@ (@ ¥ NN S YR @ Y o W @ W wel 1 am R
UL L . '
(M e (n) & wF W il S war angm, e -
“(m Wﬁﬂﬂmﬁﬁ$mﬂaﬂéuﬂﬂmémmﬁa$mw
Big @ w7
5. & Fradl & fram 10 9k wdew 3, <9F A wﬁa%wwm “BE AN e
X o
6. ua Fm @ e 12 i
(@  Sufw (19). 3R wsdeww R A WY WM W S, B A e
™ O
(@ sSufEm (2 F AR TR @ W R B N Uel W@ G
M sufem (3) ¥ T A uE ® WM W) “BE IR U @ I |
7. @ Bl @ Pram 24 ¥ Fefafes wge e o, el -
‘g a8 e, e iy e ade &1 WWe A I B%m, e Sad

mﬂaﬂwﬁ%aﬁa@aﬁwmmﬁwmaﬁﬁmm$ﬁma§wmaﬂ
aRE ¥ U Wi B _

8. & Fam 249 -
(@  sufER (1) - __ _ .
0 g () @ e W PR de e, seifd - -
“) o 1E S el TR & R SR B B e @ giiea
¥ aE ¥ W A wied by w1 Ak @, S A uEd 8
ST AT & AR w18 4 s smem 7
(i) gs () & @ w Fefaie g @ o, | —

“() 9% ¥al, Rno AR o 19 31 Sww (3) & nfia W &

fow e few W & Pow @ ade:d WA B
ATATNY A A A PEA @ Bl Aok Y Jsareid d

gt 1)
i) @S (i) @ wE W PrefaRee W@ wan s, s — )
“i) ORGSR () B I udE B Rie orRm affme @

A U A AR FiEe B B O T IRAEE A B A
a1 i (e & wiadewe @) ade § 98 aE @ da S A

LEC R mm |
fv) @S (v) ® WF W) ﬁwﬁrﬁ?ﬂa@swm sl -




[ 4T 11—\ 3(ii)] ‘ WRA T T ;. TR

10.

11.

“Gv)  HRT 16 @t SWUR (3) B I WLHWP B IR BHA BT
T WS B WA B AT RN, AdE BiEd o O aRE §
1 g afffa R @ yfdeor @) aNE ¥ ssarely 9 @ dhR
at 3R e wIEe S @l g ¥ 88 A @ faw ot o

&, 3 wmgw 7
W Es () A O aN 119 @ sl REfR R ar w=l oIl o s B
WM W W YT (WerE) sffiew 2006 @ 9w @ @@ AR 149 @
i e & 90w Bow, AE AN W W N ;
(@  oufw (2) § -
T S (i) @ Wi R el ge var e ek
“6) o7 omil & wew ¥ fornl wden @ frw oFRY W g0 £ @F
s P AR sen, 9 36 TeEH A I8E ¥ W
T A @ Y oY e @ ade W e g, W ol
wearEd 2, 8
wg v Fdw o wu ¥ fbu s, Rred sufieE () @
mmamﬂrmm%r’; ‘
) WS ) & vew, P e st R o, e -
“Gii) 9% Al Rud far Freises Was @ R &1 fFRuem &,
g feEe g W R @ it & 98w 9 ue T
g I
@ Sufw (3) 4 “Suw mRga afed S W @ WW W) “Sas Wfbed
Fhpdl B, WD WA & T iy BT 9 9t aE | BE W A1 e
@ Tl | B A @ A} ot A yeEad! 8,7 I I WK

(@ S (4) 3 R W FAefaled Sufew w@ s, s

“U4)  gRY 21 333?@?&3@?%%%%?%%@%@#%%.
O, W AR €, R Rl B U H @ iy sl & weH
T G DI AN B0 ST & aRE A BRh [ |

oo Pt @ e 26 % “(1)” Srodt Al iE 1 A e e |
T Frrl & s 6 ¥, e @) srdaeer 9 & o o Pt @ var s,

i —

“YéT & Irer wa) fadeht wrdarfear”;
Ha fgnt & gw 65 4 ‘

@) A S e PR e A v oo, R -

“(1) ¥ @ v P
@)  sfm (1) & wm R Prefale Sutem @ e, sl -

“(1)  oR1 25 & SWR (1) @ IR fRe oY & Ty anaie Wit s
F wEa fF e iR oW e & weH A ue HUd IR 9y,



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART H—SEec. 3(ii}]

. 12,’

18.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

ARk P @), T gEE @ Ry vﬁtmmﬁnﬁiﬁ IRm +f wffR
BRI |

(1) SufrEH (1) A siafde AW @@ & B g7 W, B AT W 11F @ A
HEET & WHTe B W | By W B 3@l B vl | @d erew A
fsar s 1 .
(@ SufREE (3) ¥ “SU PG B JES D GO AR & W T TH IHD B
maﬁm;‘@maﬁuﬁt&%wm”m@w; :
@)  wufEw (@) 3 ‘g ue ue B WE R DT T T W
ol el & W 558§, “a 25 @ SWR (3)” T, 3P 3R DreF F WH WU
25 3 I (2)” ¥, 3iF AR raF W@ T |
T fodl & P 56 A -
(® SulEw (1) ¥ “ﬁa‘maﬂw ma‘ra}wn{ “fm 5% @ Al g
A e, 3T MR R W S
(@ oufmw (4) 3 “amr 25 3 SUERT {4)” Tw, ol IR P @ ®WIF W) “AN 25
@ SR (3)” W, &F IR PIOF W S |
T il & P 71 @ sufiad (2) @ wIF ® Bl saftem an W, sl -
“(9 v ong frge AW e, o N waY] oWl @ e & dfta sl @

yrel & Ram, safen (1) & el B w0 e 71 Pugm s, e
mmﬂammﬁaﬂmﬁmﬁaaﬂmﬁ?a}wmm P

o Bl 3 Prm 74 & WF R PeAfafed Pre v o, s —

“74.  Ude BT W —

(1) e O SurRel Wik, S sde wed @ R g ke 2
'?ﬂaﬁa@gﬁﬁmﬁﬁfﬁewﬁmmmﬁmmﬁmm
& fau & w2 g sifda 8l !

(2 U3z T, WA ORI 43 a‘:‘mﬁhﬁézsaamﬁwwﬁaﬁm@r
i ot & e s @ snew |

Ta el & W 88 9, “TEifdn B ol “pieT wel & W W @ Il W SR
q A & “ORERT W ¥ET oo |
rlaﬁwa‘;ﬁmm & Tl (1) -
(® @3 (P & ywEm, ﬁmﬁ%mww@ahmmﬁ—

“(5®) & o™ 8. & sl YT &9 R B W 3
@ HEe@A T TE D WU W, TR A v |
o gl & fam 138 & sufEm (1) 3 “fy 24, Prom ss 3l P so(13) ¥ o=
3, Tradl Y R @ wF ). “Fan 247, Frm 55 & SOREW @) SR e eo &
Sufa (1@) 4 U 31, IR N Iod [ WA |




[ 471 [1—0E 3(ii) ] A 1 UHYR : TEERA

19. T PR & vEeh g - -
(®) W% dExie 4w IUY Ve wfafedl © wim W) f=fatia wg iR wafea «@y
ST, st -
“q, 9 53(2) 3R amy 142(4), PR 13(6), 4 300 WA AW 1200 gfd AR,
so(1®) o 130 & i WY & fawRm .

& {oY ara W
(@ W% werw 12 & wWW 2§ ‘ﬁmzw”mwaﬂvw%mw“ﬁw
245" T%, IiF T R T S | _
20. 9 fdl o gl ey -
@) FiH-
(@) ﬁweaﬁqa(;)a%m(ﬁ)ﬁ ‘R R @ WA R “onfaere
(anfasrre)) @ T’ o T S |

@ R o ¥ e 9 smavaw T € |

i) wH 4 ¥ “24d(4) (i) P 3R 3R ProHi B AW W wC

i) =% g0 F v I TTEHT T E

vy w73, “ETR‘ZS (@) wed, Il SR T T WH W “aw 25(2)” I IF
3R ProH W@ WEh ;

(v} mgﬁhzﬁ“ﬁzma%maﬂawmﬁww “Ge e
e a9 ™ W

(Vi) -W‘!B_ﬁ,— P e
@) . %1 w () & gy, et e At s, s -
“l=) e, W11$$aﬁqm$wﬁm?;
@ RA oY duE B saned T8 §
o (vi) R ae  wEiee B sadar TS
(vii) w25 H— .
(@) 3 ¥ am arer “B W FE I 1 A R S
@ fRuw & wm w Frafafe uo @ smm, s -
“RuE-(F) W AT T, FWHCT
| (@) wre & T el orggd SRew )
21, gE el A dEd orgd & wm W Frafafen st <t o, s -
. AN
(P 74 3R
1274 <& /a{ 2 ‘



Uee &1 g
UCE O ooovveneirn
SR O v
BIEH T B ARG .t
BER oo
SRGBRD (FET AL BN oo

;rmﬁraﬁmm%ﬁiﬁéaas’t TUdaT e N QUNERE .oo,
Wanﬁwa%m e Rt

ﬁgma%maa‘fa%aﬁﬂﬁmama ............................ 20..... @fmﬁ@ma‘sﬁmﬂ%

srgea e 2 .

SR A TG o o e e

 (@riw B ) |
m:—gﬂﬁ&$m$ﬁquﬁﬂ,aﬁsﬁﬁqwﬁmﬁ ...... s 20.....

B AR TD U FAEG X A G 37 7 &t

e e ————

[ 4. 14/2/2005—11’1 Hiavg & ]
T T W, RERaIEG]

fwoy - ﬁaﬁuﬁwa%wﬁaﬁqammmma(a) a2 wE, 2003 B I
mﬁamwaaﬁ?amﬂmmﬂammmmma@) arﬁazaﬁaﬁzmammf@a
fay g |

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE AND INDUSTRY
(Department of Industrial Policy and Promotion) ’
NOTIFICATION
7 New Delhi, the 5th May, 2006
8.0. 657(E).—WHEREAS a draft of certain rules further to amend the Patents Rules,

2003 was published in exercise of the power conferred by section 159 of the Patents
Act, 1970 (39 of 1970) vide notification of the Government of India in Ministry of
Commerce and Industry (Department of Industrial Policy and Promotion) vide
Number SO. 1844(E) dated the 30® December, 2005, m Part 1I se¢tion 3, sub-section
(ii) of the Gazette of India, (Extraordinary) dated 30 December, 2005 for inviting
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thercby before expiry of
a period of thirty days from the date on which copies of the Gazette containing the
Notification were made available to the public;

AND WHEREAS the copies of the Gazette containing the said Notification

were made available to the public on 2nd January, 2006; ‘ e

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—SEC. 3(ii)]

| S




[ 4T ]G 3(ii)] S T TSI : FAETER

. AND WHEREAS objections and suggestions received from the public on the

said draft rules have been considered by the Central Government;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 159 of the
Patents Act, 1970 (39 of 1970), Central Government hereby makes the following rules
further to amend the Patents Rules, 2003, namely: -

1.

[F'e]

(1) These rules may be called the Patents (Amendment) Rules, 2006.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official

Gagzette. -

In the Patents Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the pnnmpal rules), in

rule 4, in sub-rule (1),

(a) in clauses (i), the words and figures “other than under sections 39,65 and
125” shall be omitted.

(b} clause (ii) shall be omitted

In rule 6 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), the proviso shall be omitted;

- In rule 7 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (2),-

(a) in clause (a), after the words “paid in cash”, the words “or through
electronic means” shall be inserted; :
(b) in clause (b) the words “within the time aIlowed for payment of the
fees” shall be omitted;
(c) for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(c) Where a fee is payable in respect of a document, the entire fee
shall accompany the document.”;

In rule 10 and in the explanation of the principal rules, for the words “three

months”, the words “six months” shall respectively be substituted;

In rule 12 of the principal rules, - _
(a) in rule (1A) and in the explanation, for the words “three months”, the
words “six months” shall respectively be substituted;

(b) in rule (2), for the words “three months”, the words “six months”™ shall
be substituted;
(c) in rule (3), for the words “three months”, the words “‘six months” shall
be substituted:

_In rule 24 of the principal rules, the following proviso shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that the period within which the Controller shall publish the
application in the Journal shall ordinarily be one month from the date of
expiry of said period, or one month from the date of request for publication
under rule 24A.”; _

In rule 24B of the principal rules, -
(a) in sub-rule (1), -

(1) in clause (i), for the words “after the pubhcatlon of the application

but within thirty-six months”, the words “within forty-eight months”

shall be substituted; :

(ii) for clause (ii), following clause shall be substituted, namely: --

“(ii) The period within which the request for examination under
sub-section (3) of section 11B to be made shall be forty-eight
months from the date of priority, if applicable, or forty-eight
months from the date of filing of the application;

(iii) for clause (iii), following clause shall be substituted, namely:



' THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY . [ParTII—SEc. 3(ii)]

9.

10,

“(iii) The request for examination under sub-section (4) of section 11B
shall be made within forty-eight months from the date of priority or
form the date of filing of the a .plication, or within six moths from the
date of revocation of the secrecy direction, whichever is later% -

(iv) for clause (iv), following clause shall be substituted; narﬁely:

" “(iv) The request for examination of application as filed according to

the ‘Explanation’ under sub-section (3) of section 16 shall be made
within forty-eight months from the date of filing of the application or
from the date of priority of the first mentioned application or within six
months from the date of filing of the further application, wklnchever is
later;

(v) in clanse (v) for the words, figures and letter “the penod specified
under the section 11B or”, the words, figures and letter “the period
specified under the section 11B before the commencemgnt of the
Patents (Amendment) Act, 2005 or” shall be substituted; |

(b) in sub- rule (2),-

(i) for clause (i), the following clause shall be substituted, namely: -
“i)  The period within which the Controller shall refer the
application and specification and other documents to the
examiner in respect of the applications where the tequest for
examination has been received shall ordinarily be one month
from the date its publication or one month from the klate of the
request for examination whichever is later:

Provided that such reference shall be made in ordér in which
the request is filed under sub-rule (1), '

(ii) after clause (ii), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -
“(iii) the period within which the Controller shall Hispose off
the report of the examiner shall ordinarily be one thonth from
the date of the receipt of the such report by the Contrbller s

(¢) in sub rule (3), for the words “his authorised agent”, the words “l:us

authorised agent ordinarily within six months from the Hate of the
request for examination or six months from date of [pubhcatlon
whichever is later.” shall be substituted;

(d) for sub-rule (4), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely,

“(4) The time for putting an application in order for grant umder section

21 shall be twelve months from the date on which the first Staiement of
objection is issued to the applicant to comply with the requitements.”

In rule 26 of the principal rules, the figure and brackets “(1)” shall be omitted;

In Chapter VI of the principal rules, for the heading “OPPOSITION
PROCEEDINGS?, the following heading shall be substituted, namgly -
« OPPOSITION PROCEEDINGS TO GRANT OF PATEN 7




[STF1 I—&9% 3(ii)] - R 1 T : STHNR

11.  Inrule 55 of the principal rules-
(a) (i) for the marginal heading, the following marginal heading shall be
substituted, namely:-
“(1) Opposition to the patent.”;

(11) for sub-rule (1), the following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely:-
“(1) Representation for opposition under sub-section (1) of section 25
shall be filed at the appropriate office and shall include a statement and
evidence, if any, in support of the reprcsentatlon and a request for
hearing if so destred.

(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-rule(l), no patent
shall be granted before the expiry of a period of six months from the
date of publication of the application under section 11A.”,
(b) in sub-rule(3), for the word, “effect”, the words, “effect alongwﬂh a copy
of such representation” shall be substituted,

(c) in sub rule (4), for the words “one month” the words “three months.” shall

be substituted;

[2. In rule 55A of the princi;jal rules, for the words, figures and brackets “sub-section -

(3) of section 25”, the words, figures and brackets “sub-section (2) of section 257

shall be substituted;

13. In rule 56 of the principal rules, -

(a) in sub rule (1), for the words “notice of opposition”, the words, figures and

letter “notice of opposition under rule 55A” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (4), for the words, figures and brackets “sub-section (4) of
section 257, the words, figures and brackets “sub-section (3) of section 25”
shall be substituted;

14. In rule 71 of the principal rules, for sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall
be substituted, namely: -
“(2) The time within Wthh the Controller dispose of the request made
under sub-rule (1), except in case of inventions relating to defence and
atomic energy applications, shall ordinarily be within a period of
twenty one days from the date of filing of such request.”;
15. For rule 74 of the principal rules, the following rule shall be substituted,
‘namnely; - ,

“74. Form of patent:-

(1) A patent shall be in the form as specified in the Third Schedule with
such modifications as the circumstances of each case may require and shall
bear the number accorded to the application under rule 37.
(2) The patent certificate shall ordinarily be issued within seven days from
the date of grant of patent 'inder section 43.

16. In rule 88 of the principal rules, the word “sealing”, occurring at both the

' places, the word “grant”, shall be substituted;

17. In rule 134 of the principal rules, in sub rule (1), -

(a) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -
““(aa) as to when the information under section 8 has been filed.”;

(b) in clause (k), for the words “Official Gazette”, the words “Official
Journal” shall be substituted, .

1374 51786 - 3




10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY : [ParT I—SEC. 3(ii)]

18. In rule 138 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), for the words, figures and
brackets “in the rules 24,55 and 80(1A)”, the words, figures and brackets “in
the rules 24B, sub-rule (4) of rule 55 and sub-rule (1A) of rdle 80 shall be
substituted;

19. In the THE FIRST SCHEDULE of the pnncxpal rules, -

(a) for items number 4 and entries relating thereto, the folldwmg item and
entries shall be substituted, namely:-

4, On request for extension of 4 - : |
time under sections 53(2) 300 1,200 )
and 142(4), rules 13(6), ' per month per month™;
80(1A) and 130..

(b) in ttem number 12, in column 2, for the word figure e{nd letter “rule
23B”, the word figure and letter “rule 24A” shall be substituted, -

20. In the THE SECOND SCHEDULE of the principal rules,-
() mForm 1- '
(@) in para 9, in item (i), in sub-item (b) for the word “Signature(s)”,the

words “Signature(s) of the inventor(s)” shall be substituted;
(b) after para 10, for the words “The Controller of Patent” the words “The

Controller of Patents™ shall be substltuted
(ii) in Form 4, omit words figures and brackets “24B(4)(ii),”
(iti) in Form §, after Para 4, for the words “The Controller of’Patent”, the
words “The Controller of Patents” shall be'suﬁstituted; ;
(iv) in Form 7, for the words bracket and figure “See sections 25(3)” the
words bracket and figure “See section 25(2)” shall be substituted'
(v) in Form 9, in Para 2, for the words * appllcatlon for Patent Nb the words
“Patent application No.” shall be substituted; :
(vi) in Form 18, -
(a) in Para 1, after item (c), the followmg item shall be added namely:
“d) date of publication of the application under section:
A o
(b) after Para 4, for the words “The Controller of Patent” the words
“The Controller of Patents” shall be substituted;
(vii) in Form 21, in Para 1, for the words “patent No./No.”, the words “Patent
No.” shall be substituted,

(viii) in Form 25,




[ 9 [I—8&v€ 3(ii) ] WA T A9 : SATTHR

1

(a) the words “No Fee”, occurring iﬁ the beginning shall be
omitted,;
(b)for the Note, the following Note shall be substituted, namely:-
“ Note — (a) Strike out whichever is not applicable
(b) For fee see first schedule.”;
21. For THE THIRD SCHEDULE of the principal rules, the following Sche(.iule

shall be substituted, namely:- :

“THE THIRD SCHEDULE

(Refer rule 74)
- FORM OF PATENT

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
Patent No........ccooo vveeninns
Application No. .— ........... craenran
Date of filing ............c.c.cens
Patentee.........coviviiiiiiiiniii et ee et naeeaaaae e aaas
Inventor(s) (Where applicable)........co..ooviiiiiiviiiiniineeieennen, e

It is hereby certified that a patent has been granted to the patentee for an
invention entitled............... e ereereteeaeaeeeeiaaeas J PSR
as disclosed in the above mentioned application for the term of 20 years from
the........... day of..........c....u 19/20........... , in accordance with the
provisions of the Patents Act, 1970. '

- Date of Grant---—------ - Controller of Patents

(Seal of the Office) - ' -

Note. — The fees for renewal of this patent, if it is to be maintained, will fall
due on............. day of .............. 20.....-and on the same day in every year
thereafter.”. e

[F. No. 14/2/2005-PP & C]
N.N.PRASAD, Jt. Secy.

Note:— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India vide

Notification number S.0. 493 (E) dated the 2™ May, 2003 and subsequently
amended vide notification No. S.0. 1418(E) dated 28" December, 2004.

Printed by the Manager, Govt, of lndia Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controlier of Publications, Deihi-110054.

e e

-

i



